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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aAer the shipment.Paperback Pages Number: 574 Language: Simplified Chinese Publisher: China
Communications Press; 1st edition (September 1. 2010). Colleges trial materials Chang'an Road TraFic and
Transportation Engineering Experiment Teaching Center. the experimental teaching guide books (set 7) Set the
book. respectively. include: Logistics Engineering Experiment Volume experimental volumes of traFic safety
engineering. engineering thermodynamics and engine principle experiment Volume. Vehicle Inspection
Technology Experiment Volume. Automotive application of engineering experiments Volume. automotive
structures the experimental volumes. vehicle performance experimental volumes . In modern society. the
economy. the logistics system determines the configuration and the rational flow of factors of production.
directly restricts the degree of utilization of social resources and utilization levels. thereby restricting the
macro-economic eFiciency and microeconomic eFiciency. Modern logistics as an advanced organization and
management techniques. is the source of enterprises to reduce costs. improve eFiciency plays an important
role in the economic and social development. In the trend of global economic integration. the logistics of this
emerging industry in recent years been expanding in China. in 2009. the logistics industry has been listed as the
revitalization of China's top ten industries. At the same time. demand for all kinds of logistics talent is
increasingly urgent. logistics personnel has been identified as one of the shortage of qualified personnel of 12
categories. The face of the enterprise market demand for logistics personnel always on the lookout. domestic
everyone colleges. training institutions. professional education. short-term training is in full swing to carry out.
However. due to logistics education and training institutions to provide a short time. lack of experience. leading
to the breeders and the practical needs of the enterprise deviation is oAen theory more than a lack of
practice.Four...
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